
Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

1

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up ******** ******** ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Ash, Fly

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 52,150

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4B

Pickup

Transfer Station

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

2

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 12.00 19.50 31.50 31.25 7.50 38.75 14.50 11.00 25.50 1

Any County Road 12.00 21.17 33.17 31.25 9.00 40.25 14.50 12.00 26.50 1

Stockpile 12.00 21.00 33.00 31.25 9.50 40.75 14.50 11.00 25.50 1

Any County Road 12.00 22.67 34.67 31.25 11.00 42.25 14.50 12.00 26.50 1

Stockpile 12.00 20.33 32.33 31.25 8.00 39.25 14.50 11.00 25.50 1

Any County Road 12.00 22.00 34.00 31.25 9.50 40.75 14.50 12.00 26.50 1

Stockpile 12.00 22.33 34.33 31.25 10.00 41.25 14.50 11.00 25.50 1

Stockpile 12.00 24.80 36.80 31.25 10.50 41.75 14.50 11.00 25.50 1

Any County Road 12.00 26.50 38.50 31.25 12.00 43.25 14.50 12.00 26.50 1

Stockpile 12.00 20.50 32.50 31.25 8.50 39.75 0.00

Pick-Up 12.00 ******** ******** 31.25 ******** ******** 14.50

Pick-Up Location

1 - PCT 1,2,3

5080 FM 2439 NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 1768 N NURSERY DR NURSERY, TX ALTAIR, TX

Bull Rock, Clean

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 650

1

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD                           

NEW BRAUNFELS

2

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD                    

NURSERY

3

PRIHODA GRAVEL

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

Pickup

Precinct #4
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

3

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 19.00 31.59 50.59 20.00 10.00 30.00 2 0.00

Any County Road 19.00 31.59 50.59 20.00 12.00 32.00 2 0.00

Stockpile 19.00 34.02 53.02 20.00 7.50 27.50 2 0.00

Any County Road 19.00 34.02 53.02 20.00 9.50 29.50 2 0.00

Stockpile 19.00 31.59 50.59 20.00 10.75 30.75 2 0.00

Any County Road 19.00 31.59 50.59 20.00 12.50 32.50 2 0.00

Stockpile 19.00 39.19 58.19 20.00 10.00 30.00 2 0.00

Stockpile 19.00 35.19 54.19 20.00 11.75 31.75 2 0.00

Any County Road 19.00 35.19 54.19 20.00 12.00 32.00 2 0.00

Stockpile 19.00 32.78 51.78 20.00 10.00 30.00 0.00

Pick-Up 19.00 ******** ******** 20.00 ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

2 - PCT 2,3

1604 O'CONNOR PLANT ALTAIR, TX

(CONTINUED)                                         

Bull Rock, Clean

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 650

4

VULCAN CONSTRUCTION 

5

ZBRANEK GRAVEL
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

4

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 11.00 11.00 22.00 1 15.00 10.00 25.00 2 0.00

Any County Road 11.00 12.00 23.00 1 15.00 12.00 27.00 2 0.00

Stockpile 11.00 11.00 22.00 1 15.00 7.50 22.50 2 0.00

Any County Road 11.00 12.00 23.00 1 15.00 9.50 24.50 2 0.00

Stockpile 11.00 11.00 22.00 1 15.00 10.75 25.75 2 0.00

Any County Road 11.00 12.00 23.00 1 15.00 12.50 27.50 2 0.00

Stockpile 11.00 11.00 22.00 1 15.00 10.00 25.00 2 0.00

Stockpile 11.00 11.00 22.00 1 15.00 11.75 26.75 2 0.00

Any County Road 11.00 12.00 23.00 1 15.00 12.00 27.00 2 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 15.00 10.00 25.00 0.00

Pick-Up 11.00 15.00 ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

1 - ALL PCTS 2 - ALL PCTS

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Precinct #4A

Bull Rock, with Clay

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 950

1

PRIHODA GRAVEL

2

ZBRANEK GRAVEL

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

Pickup

ALTAIR, TX ALTAIR, TX

Precinct #1
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

5

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 6.00 9.00 15.00 3 4.75 9.00 13.75 1 4.00 10.00 14.00 2
Any County Road 6.00 10.00 16.00 2 4.75 11.00 15.75 1 4.00 12.00 16.00 3

Stockpile 6.00 11.00 17.00 3 4.75 6.50 11.25 1 4.00 7.50 11.50 2

Any County Road 6.00 12.00 18.00 3 4.75 8.50 13.25 1 4.00 9.50 13.50 2

Stockpile 6.00 10.00 16.00 4.75 9.75 14.50 1 4.00 10.75 14.75 2

Any County Road 6.00 11.00 17.00 4.75 11.50 16.25 1 4.00 12.50 16.50 2

Stockpile 6.00 12.50 18.50 4.75 9.00 13.75 1 4.00 10.00 14.00 2

Stockpile 6.00 12.50 18.50 4.75 11.00 15.75 2 4.00 11.75 15.75 1

Any County Road 6.00 12.50 18.50 4.75 11.00 15.75 1 4.00 12.00 16.00 2

Stockpile 6.00 10.50 16.50 2 0.00 4.00 10.00 14.00 1

Pick-Up 6.00 4.75 4.00

Pick-Up Location

1 - PCT 1 2 - PCT 2,3,4 1 - PCT 2,3,4

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

STRATTON ALTAIR, TX ALTAIR, TX

Pickup

Precinct #1

Precinct #3

Gravel, Pit Run

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 11,000 

1

ALL STAR MATERIALS

2

PRIHODA GRAVEL

3

ZBRANEK GRAVEL

Precinct #2

Transfer Station
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

6

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 6.50 9.00 15.50 1 7.00 16.00 23.00 2 0.00

Any County Road 6.50 10.00 16.50 1 7.00 18.00 25.00 2 0.00

Stockpile 6.50 11.00 17.50 1 7.00 16.00 23.00 2 0.00

Any County Road 6.50 12.00 18.50 1 7.00 18.00 25.00 2 0.00

Stockpile 6.50 10.00 16.50 1 7.00 16.00 23.00 2 0.00

Any County Road 6.50 11.00 17.50 1 7.00 18.00 25.00 2 0.00

Stockpile 6.50 12.50 19.00 1 7.00 16.00 23.00 2 0.00

Stockpile 6.50 12.50 19.00 1 7.00 18.00 25.00 2 0.00

Any County Road 6.50 12.50 19.00 1 7.00 18.00 25.00 2 0.00

Stockpile 6.50 10.50 17.00 1 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up 6.50 7.00 ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

1 - ALL PCTS 2 - ALL PCTS

Pickup

Precinct #1

ALTAIR, TXSTRATTON

Gravel, Post Oak Pit Run with Red Clay

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 13,500 

1

ALL STAR MATERIALS

2

PRIHODA GRAVEL

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Precinct #2
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

7

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 8.00 9.00 17.00 3 6.00 9.25 15.25 1 5.75 10.00 15.75 2

Any County Road 8.00 10.00 18.00 3 6.00 11.00 17.00 1 5.75 12.00 17.75 2

Stockpile 8.00 11.00 19.00 6.00 6.75 12.75 1 5.75 7.50 13.25 2

Any County Road 8.00 12.00 20.00 6.00 8.75 14.75 1 5.75 9.50 15.25 2

Stockpile 8.00 10.00 18.00 6.00 10.00 16.00 1 5.75 10.75 16.50 2

Any County Road 8.00 11.00 19.00 6.00 11.75 17.75 1 5.75 12.50 18.25 2

Stockpile 8.00 12.50 20.50 6.00 9.25 15.25 1 5.75 10.00 15.75 2

Stockpile 8.00 12.50 20.50 6.00 11.00 17.00 1 5.75 11.75 17.50 2

Any County Road 8.00 12.50 20.50 6.00 11.25 17.25 1 5.75 12.00 17.75 2

Stockpile 8.00 10.50 18.50 2 0.00 5.75 10.00 15.75 1

Pick-Up 8.00 6.00 5.75

Pick-Up Location

1 - PCT 1 2 - PCT 2,3,4 1 - PCT 2,3,4

Pickup

STRATTON ALTAIR, TX ALTAIR, TX

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Gravel, Screened

Unit:  Tons

Total Quantity: 11,750

1

ALL STAR MATERIALS

2

PRIHODA GRAVEL

3

ZBRANEK GRAVEL

Precinct #1

Transfer Station

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

8

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 8.00 9.00 17.00 6.00 9.25 15.25 1 5.75 10.00 15.75 2

Any County Road 8.00 10.00 18.00 6.00 11.00 17.00 1 5.75 12.00 17.75 2

Stockpile 8.00 11.00 19.00 6.00 6.75 12.75 1 5.75 7.50 13.25 2

Any County Road 8.00 12.00 20.00 6.00 8.75 14.75 1 5.75 9.50 15.25 2

Stockpile 8.00 10.00 18.00 6.00 9.75 15.75 1 5.75 10.75 16.50 2

Any County Road 8.00 11.00 19.00 6.00 11.75 17.75 1 5.75 12.50 18.25 2

Stockpile 8.00 12.50 20.50 6.00 9.25 15.25 1 5.75 10.00 15.75 2

Stockpile 8.00 12.50 20.50 6.00 11.00 17.00 1 5.75 11.75 17.50 2

Any County Road 8.00 12.50 20.50 6.00 11.25 17.25 1 5.75 12.00 17.75 2

Stockpile 8.00 10.50 18.50 0.00 5.75 10.00 15.75

Pick-Up 8.00 6.00 5.75

Pick-Up Location

1 - PCT 2,3,42 - PCT 2,3,41 - PCT 1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

STRATTON ALTAIR, TX ALTAIR, TX

Pickup

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Gravel, Screened with Red Clay

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 12,575

1

ALL STAR MATERIALS

2

PRIHODA GRAVEL

3

ZBRANEK GRAVEL

Precinct #1
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

9

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 215.00 39.90 254.90 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 215.00 39.90 254.90 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 215.00 39.90 254.90 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 215.00 39.90 254.90 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 215.00 39.90 254.90 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 215.00 39.90 254.90 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 215.00 39.90 254.90 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 215.00 39.90 254.90 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 215.00 39.90 254.90 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 215.00 39.90 254.90 1 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up 215.00 ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

1 - ALL PCTS

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

NEW BRAUNFELS, TX

Pickup

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Lime Hi-Cal Hydrated, Bagged

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 300

1

LHOIST

Precinct #1

Bid Results FY 2019 01/10/2019



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

10

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 135.00 39.90 174.90 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 135.00 39.90 174.90 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 135.00 39.90 174.90 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 135.00 39.90 174.90 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 135.00 39.90 174.90 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 135.00 39.90 174.90 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 135.00 39.90 174.90 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 135.00 39.90 174.90 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 135.00 39.90 174.90 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 135.00 39.90 174.90 1 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up 135.00 ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

1 - ALL PCTS

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

NEW BRAUNFELS, TX

Pickup

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Lime, Hi-Cal Hydraged, Not Bagged 

with Application (Pellitized)

Unit:  Tons

Total Quantity: 200

1

LHOIST **

Precinct #1

Bid Results FY 2019 01/10/2019



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

11

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 5.50 16.50 22.00 2 5.50 17.25 22.75 4.50 17.50 22.00 1

Any County Road 5.50 17.50 23.00 2 0.00 4.50 17.50 22.00 1

Stockpile 5.50 17.50 23.00 3 5.50 17.25 22.75 2 4.50 17.50 22.00 1

Any County Road 5.50 17.50 23.00 2 0.00 4.50 17.50 22.00 1

Stockpile 5.50 17.50 23.00 5.50 17.25 22.75 2 4.50 17.50 22.00 1

Any County Road 5.50 17.50 23.00 0.00 4.50 17.50 22.00 1

Stockpile 5.50 17.50 23.00 2 5.50 17.25 22.75 1 4.50 21.00 25.50

Stockpile 5.50 17.50 23.00 2 5.50 17.25 22.75 1 4.50 21.00 25.50

Any County Road 5.50 17.50 23.00 1 0.00 4.50 21.00 25.50 2

Stockpile 5.50 17.50 23.00 5.50 17.25 22.75 2 4.50 17.50 22.00 1

Pick-Up NB ******** ******** 31.00 ******** ******** 28.00

Pick-Up Location

1 - ALL PCTS

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

- BAY CITY, TX

Pickup

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

3

QUALITY HOT MIX

Precinct #1

Limestone, 3/4" to Dust

Unit: Tons 

Total Quantity: 5,450

1

ALL STAR MATERIALS

2

K-C LEASE DBA MATAGORDA 

CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

Bid Results FY 2019 01/10/2019



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

12

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 12.00 19.50 31.50 31.25 7.50 38.75 5.50 18.15 23.65 2

Any County Road 12.00 21.17 33.17 31.25 9.00 40.25 0.00

Stockpile 12.00 21.00 33.00 31.25 9.50 40.75 5.50 18.15 23.65 2

Any County Road 12.00 22.67 34.67 31.25 11.00 42.25 0.00

Stockpile 12.00 20.33 32.33 31.25 8.00 39.25 5.50 18.15 23.65 2

Any County Road 12.00 22.00 34.00 31.25 9.50 40.75 0.00

Stockpile 12.00 22.33 34.33 31.25 10.00 41.25 5.50 18.15 23.65 1

Stockpile 12.00 24.80 36.80 31.25 10.50 41.75 5.50 18.15 23.65 1

Any County Road 12.00 26.50 38.50 31.25 12.00 43.25 0.00

Stockpile 12.00 20.50 32.50 31.25 8.50 39.75 5.50 18.15 23.65 1

Pick-Up 12.00 31.25 ******** ******** 31.00 ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

1 - PCT 3

5080 FM 2439 NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 1768 N NURSERY DR NURSERY, TX BAY CITY, TX

Pickup

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Precinct #4A

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

Precinct #1

Limestone, 1 1/2" to 1"

Unit:  Tons

Total Quantity: 6,500

1

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NEW BRAUNFELS

2

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NURSERY

3

K-C LEASE DBA MATAGORDA 

CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

Bid Results FY 2019 01/10/2019



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

13

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 4.50 19.00 23.50 1 30.00 19.12 49.12 0.00

Any County Road 4.50 19.00 23.50 1 30.00 19.12 49.12 0.00

Stockpile 4.50 18.00 22.50 1 30.00 18.39 48.39 0.00

Any County Road 4.50 18.00 22.50 1 30.00 18.39 48.39 0.00

Stockpile 4.50 19.00 23.50 1 30.00 19.12 49.12 0.00

Any County Road 4.50 19.00 23.50 1 30.00 19.12 49.12 0.00

Stockpile 4.50 20.00 24.50 2 30.00 17.58 47.58 0.00

Stockpile 4.50 20.00 24.50 2 30.00 17.58 47.58 0.00

Any County Road 4.50 20.00 24.50 1 30.00 17.58 47.58 0.00

Stockpile 4.50 20.50 25.00 2 30.00 19.12 49.12 0.00

Pick-Up 28.00 30.00 ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

1 - PCT 2,4

Pickup

(CONTINUED)                           

Limestone, 1 1/2" to 1"

Unit:  Tons

Total Quantity: 6,500

4

QUALITY HOT MIX

5

VULCAN CONSTRUCTION

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

FREEPORT YARD

Precinct #1

Bid Results FY 2019 01/10/2019



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

14

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 4.50 16.50 21.00 1 3.00 19.50 22.50 2 19.50 7.50 27.00

Any County Road 4.50 17.50 22.00 1 3.00 21.17 24.17 2 19.50 9.00 28.50

Stockpile NB NB 3.00 21.00 24.00 1 19.50 9.50 29.00

Any County Road NB NB 3.00 22.67 25.67 1 19.50 11.00 30.50

Stockpile NB NB 3.00 20.33 23.33 1 19.50 8.00 27.50

Any County Road NB NB 3.00 22.00 25.00 1 19.50 9.50 29.00

Stockpile NB NB 3.00 22.33 25.33 1 19.50 10.00 29.50

Stockpile NB NB 3.00 24.80 27.80 1 19.50 10.50 30.00

Any County Road NB NB 3.00 26.50 29.50 1 19.50 12.00 31.50

Stockpile NB NB 3.00 20.50 23.50 19.50 8.50 28.00

Pick-Up NB ******** ******** 3.00 19.50

Pick-Up Location

1 - PCT 3 1 - PCT 1

Limestone, Dust

Unit: Tons 

Total Quantity: 1,250

1

ALL STAR MATERIALS

2

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NEW BRAUNFELS

3

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NURSERY

- 5080 FM 2439 NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 1768 N NURSERY DR NURSERY, TX

Pickup

Transfer Station

Precinct #4

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4A

Precinct #3

Precinct #2

Precinct #1

Bid Results FY 2019 01/10/2019



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

15

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 7.00 20.00 27.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 7.00 22.00 29.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 7.00 21.00 28.00 2 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 7.00 23.00 30.00 2 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 7.00 20.00 27.00 2 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 7.00 22.00 29.00 2 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 7.00 22.50 29.50 2 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 7.00 22.50 29.50 2 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 7.00 23.50 30.50 2 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 7.00 20.50 27.50 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up 29.00 ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

1 - PCT 4

(CONTINUED)                               

Limestone, Dust

Unit: Tons 

Total Quantity: 1,250

4

QUALITY HOT MIX

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Bid Results FY 2019 01/10/2019



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

16

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 25.00 19.50 44.50 41.25 7.50 48.75 7.00 19.50 26.50 1

Any County Road 25.00 21.17 46.17 41.25 9.00 50.25 7.00 20.50 27.50 1

Stockpile 25.00 21.00 46.00 41.25 9.50 50.75 7.00 21.50 28.50 1

Any County Road 25.00 22.67 47.67 41.25 11.00 52.25 7.00 22.50 29.50 1

Stockpile 25.00 20.33 45.33 41.25 8.00 49.25 7.00 20.50 27.50 1

Any County Road 25.00 22.00 47.00 41.25 9.50 50.75 7.00 21.50 28.50 1

Stockpile 25.00 22.33 47.33 41.25 10.00 51.25 7.00 22.40 29.40 1

Stockpile 25.00 24.80 49.80 41.25 10.50 51.75 7.00 23.40 30.40 1

Any County Road 25.00 26.50 51.50 41.25 12.00 53.25 7.00 23.40 30.40 1

Stockpile 25.00 20.50 45.50 41.25 8.50 49.75 0.00

Pick-Up 25.00 41.25 ******** ******** 31.50

Pick-Up Location

1 - PCT 3 1 - PCT 2,4

Limestone, Grade 5 (Ice Rock)

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 700

1

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NEW BRAUNFELS

2

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NURSERY

3 

QUALITY HOT MIX

Precinct #1

5080 FM 2439 NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 1768 N NURSERY DR NURSERY, TX

Pickup

Transfer Station

Precinct #4

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4A

Precinct #3

Precinct #2

Bid Results FY 2019 01/10/2019



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

17

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 15.00 20.00 35.00 2 20.00 19.50 39.50 38.25 7.50 45.75

Any County Road 15.00 21.00 36.00 1 20.00 21.17 41.17 38.25 9.00 47.25

Stockpile 15.00 21.00 36.00 2 20.00 21.00 41.00 38.25 9.50 47.75

Any County Road 15.00 22.00 37.00 1 20.00 22.67 42.67 38.25 11.00 49.25

Stockpile 15.00 20.00 35.00 2 20.00 20.31 40.31 38.25 8.00 46.25

Any County Road 15.00 20.00 35.00 1 20.00 22.00 42.00 38.25 9.50 47.75

Stockpile 15.00 20.00 35.00 1 20.00 22.33 42.33 38.25 10.00 48.25

Stockpile 15.00 21.00 36.00 1 20.00 24.80 44.80 38.25 10.50 48.75

Any County Road 15.00 22.00 37.00 1 20.00 26.50 46.50 38.25 12.00 50.25

Stockpile 15.00 20.00 35.00 20.00 20.50 40.50 38.25 8.50 46.75

Pick-Up NB ******** ******** 20.00 38.25 ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

1 - PCT 3

Limestone, Non-Coated Grade 4

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 5,900

1

ALL STAR MATERIALS

2

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NEW BRAUNFELS

3

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NURSERY

Precinct #1

Pickup

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

- 5080 FM 2439 NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 1768 N NURSERY DR NURSERY, TX
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 14.00 20.75 34.75 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 14.00 22.75 36.75 2 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 14.00 21.75 35.75 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 14.00 23.75 37.75 2 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 14.00 20.75 34.75 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 14.00 22.75 36.75 2 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 14.00 23.25 37.25 2 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 14.00 23.25 37.25 2 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 14.00 24.75 38.75 2 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up 37.50 ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

1 - PCT 2,4

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

(CONTINUED)                           

Limestone, Non-Coated Grade 4

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 5,900

4

QUALITY HOT MIX
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 40.00 19.50 59.50 50.51 7.50 58.01 2 43.00 7.00 50.00 1

Any County Road 40.00 21.17 61.17 50.51 9.00 59.51 2 43.00 8.00 51.00 1

Stockpile 40.00 21.00 61.00 50.51 9.50 60.01 2 43.00 9.00 52.00 1

Any County Road 40.00 22.67 62.67 50.51 11.00 61.51 2 43.00 10.00 53.00 1

Stockpile 40.00 20.31 60.31 50.51 8.00 58.51 2 43.00 8.00 51.00 1

Any County Road 40.00 22.00 62.00 50.51 9.50 60.01 2 43.00 9.00 52.00 1

Stockpile 40.00 22.33 62.33 50.51 10.00 60.51 2 43.00 9.50 52.50 1

Stockpile 40.00 24.80 64.80 50.51 10.50 61.01 2 43.00 10.50 53.50 1

Any County Road 40.00 26.50 66.50 50.51 12.00 62.51 2 43.00 10.50 53.50 1

Stockpile 40.00 20.50 60.50 50.51 8.50 59.01 0.00

Pick-Up 40.00 50.51 ******** ******** 43.00

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

5080 FM 2439 NEW BRAUNFELS, TX 1768 N NURSERY DR NURSERY, TX

Limestone, Pre-Coated Grade 4

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 1,850

1

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NEW BRAUNFELS

2

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NURSERY

3

QUALITY HOT MIX

Precinct #1

Pickup

Precinct #4A

1 - PCT 3 1 - PCT 1,2,4

Precinct #2

Precinct #3
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 22.00 60.39 82.39 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 22.00 62.00 84.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 22.00 61.19 83.19 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 22.00 63.59 85.59 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 22.00 63.59 85.59 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 22.00 62.00 84.00 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up 22.00 ******** ******** ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

UVALDE

(CONITNUED)                                        

Limestone, Pre-Coated Grade 4

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 1,850

4

VULCAN CONSTRUCTION 

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 75.00 9.50 84.50 2 74.00 6.00 80.00 1 92.00 23.32 115.32

Any County Road 75.00 11.00 86.00 2 74.00 7.00 81.00 1 92.00 0.23 92.23

Stockpile 75.00 11.50 86.50 2 74.00 6.00 80.00 1 92.00 22.08 114.08

Any County Road 75.00 12.00 87.00 2 74.00 7.00 81.00 1 92.00 0.23 92.23

Stockpile 75.00 10.00 85.00 2 74.00 6.00 80.00 1 92.00 23.98 115.98

Any County Road 75.00 11.50 86.50 2 74.00 7.00 81.00 1 92.00 0.23 92.23

Stockpile 75.00 12.00 87.00 2 74.00 6.00 80.00 1 92.00 24.20 116.20

Stockpile 75.00 12.50 87.50 2 74.00 7.00 81.00 1 92.00 0.23 92.23

Any County Road 75.00 14.00 89.00 2 74.00 7.00 81.00 1 92.00 0.23 92.23

Stockpile 75.00 10.50 85.50 0.00 92.00 23.00 115.00

Pick-Up 75.00 74.00 92.00 ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

1768 N NURSERY DR NURSERY, TX PLANT HEMPSTEAD

Mix, Cold

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 2,600

1

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NURSERY

2

QUALITY HOT MIX

3

WALLER COUNTY ASPHALT

Precinct #1

Pickup

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

2 - PCT 2,3,4 1 - ALL PCTS
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 40.00 78.39 118.39 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 40.00 80.00 120.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 40.00 79.19 119.19 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 40.00 81.59 121.59 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 40.00 81.59 121.59 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 40.00 80.00 120.00 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up 40.00 ******** ******** ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location UVALDE

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

Transfer Station

Pickup

(CONTINUED)                                        

Mix, Cold

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 2,600

4

VULCAN CONSTRUCTION 
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 70.00 9.50 79.50 2 58.00 6.00 64.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 70.00 11.00 81.00 2 58.00 7.00 65.00 1 0.00

Stockpile 70.00 11.50 81.50 2 58.00 6.00 64.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 70.00 12.00 82.00 2 58.00 7.00 65.00 1 0.00

Stockpile 70.00 10.00 80.00 2 58.00 6.00 64.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 70.00 11.50 81.50 2 58.00 7.00 65.00 1 0.00

Stockpile 70.00 12.00 82.00 2 58.00 6.00 64.00 1 0.00

Stockpile 70.00 12.50 82.50 2 58.00 7.00 65.00 1 0.00

Any County Road 70.00 14.00 84.00 2 58.00 7.00 65.00 1 0.00

Stockpile 70.00 10.50 80.50 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up 70.00 ******** ******** 58.00 ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

1768 N NURSERY DR NURSERY, TX

Mix, Hot

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 1,650

1

COLORADO MATERIALS LTD

NURSERY

2

QUALITY HOT MIX

Precinct #1

Pickup

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4

1 - ALL PCTS

Bid Results FY 2019 01/10/2019



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
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 Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 2.99 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up 2.99 ******** ******** NONE ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

ELM MOTT, TX

Pot Hole Emulsion

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 17,500

1

P2 EMULSION

Precinct #1

Pickup

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up ******** ******** ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

Stabilizer with Application

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 12,000

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Precinct #1

Pickup

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile NB NB 0.00 0.00

Any County Road NB NB 0.00 0.00

Stockpile NB NB 0.00 0.00

Any County Road NB NB 0.00 0.00

Stockpile NB NB 0.00 0.00

Any County Road NB NB 0.00 0.00

Stockpile NB NB 0.00 0.00

Stockpile NB NB 0.00 0.00

Any County Road NB NB 0.00 0.00

Stockpile NB NB 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up 3.50 ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

NOT LISTED

1 - ALL PCTS

Recycled Stabilizer Road Base

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 5,500

1

INLAND RECYCLING

Precinct #1

Pickup

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Pick-Up ******** ******** ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Transfer Station

Cement Stabilizer with Application

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 550

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Precinct #1

Pickup

Precinct #4A

Precinct #4B

Precinct #4
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Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
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Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Material Delivery
Material + 

Delivery
Rank

Stockpile 11.95 0 11.95 1

Any County Road 11.95 0 11.95 1

Stockpile 11.95 0 11.95 1

Any County Road 11.95 0 11.95 1

Stockpile 11.95 0 11.95 1

Any County Road 11.95 0 11.95 1

Stockpile 11.95 0 11.95 1

Any County Road 11.95 0 11.95 1

Stockpile 11.95 0 11.95

Any County Road 11.95 0 11.95

Pick-Up 11.95 ******** ******** NONE ******** ******** ******** ********

Pick-Up Location

NOTES:
* JACO PACK (5 GALLON PAILS) $59.75

** Quoted Bulk price is for Quicklime Pellitized. If Hydrated Lime is needed the price is the same but there will be an $8.00 per ton Spreader Bar fee added.

*** Waller County Asphalt and Vulcan Materials submitted the Affidavit without notarization.

**** Lhoist: Hours of Allowable Demurrage at NO Charge - 2 hours

Hourly Rate AFTER Hours of Allowable Demurrage at No Charge - $85 per hour

*****Quality - All deliveries in end dump trailers. Belly dumps may be requested and will be provided if available. Minimum load is 24 tons.

*******Vulcan:  Limestone, Precoated Grade 4 - Limestone Rock Asphalt Precoat = 1.05 tons per cubic yard. Cold Mix - Item 330 Limestone Rock Asphalt Premix. 

Tranfer Station

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4

NOT LISTED

Road Stabilizer (Product only)

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 1,450

1

JACO INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY INC *

Precinct #1

Pickup

****** Waller County Asphalt - Cold mix material bid by Waller County Asphalt falls under TXDOT DMs 9202 (ASPPM) All Season Pre-Coated Patching mixture Grade 

IV. Any County Rd delivery is calculated at .23/ton loaded mile.
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